BILL NO. $-13-02-06
SPECIAL ORDINANCE NO. S-

AN ORDINANCE approving the awarding of ITB
#3313 AND [ITB #3590 FOR VEHICLE
PURCHASES by the City of Fort Wayne, Indiana,
by and through its Department of Purchasing and
KELLY CHEVROLET, O'DANIEL FORD, AND
BOB THOMAS FORD for the VARIOUS
DEPARTMENTS WITHIN THE CITY OF FORT
WAYNE, INDIANA.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COMMON COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF FORT WAYNE, INDIANA;

SECTION 1. That ITB #3313 AND ITB #3590 FOR VEHICLE
PURCHASES between the City of Fort Wayne, by and through its
Department of Purchasing and KELLY CHEVROLET, O'DANIEL FORD, AND
BOB THOMAS FORD for the VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS WITHIN THE CITY
OF FORT WAYNE, INDIANA, respectfully for:

purchase of replacement vehicles for different City departments
for out-of-life cycle vehicles

involving a total cost of ONE MILLION, NINE HUNDRED NINETY-SEVEN
THOUSAND, EIGHT HUNDRED THIRTY-FOUR AND 89/100 DOLLARS -
($1,997,834.89) - (KELLY - $1,469,249.89; O'DANIEL - $113,943.00; BOB
THOMAS - $414,642,00) all as more particularly set forth in said ITB #3313
AND ITB #3590 FOR VEHICLE PURCHASES which is on file in the Office of
the Department of Purchasing, and is by reference incorporated herein, made

a part hereof, and is hereby in all things ratified, confirmed and approved.
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SECTION 2. That this Ordinance shali be in full force and effect

from and after its passage and any and all necessary approval by the Mayor.

Council Member

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY

Carol Helton, City Attorney




[ITE 3590127512

Sam
Odaniel Ben Davis | Ben Davis Swope Auto Kelly Advantage
4x2 PICKUPS Ford Ford Chevrolet Group Chevrolet (Uebelhor Ford |
Ttem 41 4x2 6,050 GVW Regular Cab (F150/1500 $long bed V6)
$18,662.00| 518,669.00] b 1] 518,603.23 | $18,120.00 | $17,994.00.| 518,285.00
Ttom 41452 6,050 GVW Regular Cab (F1507500 Siong bed V5)
$19,463.00 | 'S 19.780.001 § 19,191.06: $19,363:14 | $18.745.00 | $18:563.00 | $19.140.00
Ttem 41C 4x2 6,700 GVW Extended Cab (FISU/1500 6.5 bed) $23,000.00 | $22,125.00 | $22.230.95| 520.252.00| $21,647.23|'$20,065.00 | $20,884.00 | $20:930:00-
Ttem 44 4x2 5.000 GVW Reeular Cab (F250/2500 KD 8" long bed) | $22,438.00| §23.842.00| $ 20,092.00!'$:20,454.001 $22,358.35 | $20,542.00 | $20,304.00 | $20.638.00 |
Trom 44D 42 5,000 GVW Dxtonded Cab (2302500 B0 8 Jong |-
bed propanc) | $25343.00| $32,34641] nb ne | $31,815.00 | n. nfb
Ttem 44C 42 8,000 GVW Extended Cab (F250/2500 HD §° bed) b ]
- $24,526.00 | $25,084.00] $23.583.91/ 8 | $24,124.35] $22.465.00 | Non Compha $22,930.00
Ttem 44C 42 8,000 GVW Exteaded Cab (F250/2500 HD 6' bed) G
$24,352.00 | $24.824.00 | $22.753.91 | $22.265.00| $24.272.35|'522.050.00 | Non Compiia $22,760.00
4x4 PICKUPS
Ttem 46 434 6.000 GYW Standard Cab (FIS0/1500 S long bed) | 523,309.00] $22,938.00| §22.433.56| $20,725,00 | $23.224.23 | $21:353.00 | Non Complid $20,550.00°
‘Non e
Ttem $6C 4x4 6.250 GVW Extended Cab (FIS0/1500 %" long bed) | §24,838.001 comphiant |5 2470025 5 0] §24,859.23 | $24,300.00 | $24,111.00 | $24.240.00
Non ST .
Ttom 46C 4x4 6250 GVW Standard Cab (FI5071500 &' lonz bed) | $25.477.00 | compliant | $24,389.20 5 1 $24,63723 | $23.325.00 | Non Complia $23.920.00
Ttom 49 x4 5,000 GVW Regular Cab (P250/25000D & bed) S I!J ul
$2407400] &b | 523487.61| $22.887.00| $22.804:35 ] $52 870,00 | Non Complid $23.380.00
Item 498 4x49.201 GVW Reaular Cab (F350/3500HD 8' bed) | $25,825.00 | $26.337.00 $24.342.30 [ $221955.00| $25.745.35 | $23.895.00 | $23.744.00 | $24.130.00
Ttem 49C 4x4 9,000 GVW Extended Cab (F250/2500HD 8 bed) | $27.162.004 $27.605.00| §25,279.50 | $24.975.00| $26,982.35 | $24.960.00| Non Complid $25.465.00
Non G
Ttom 49C 4x4 5,000 GVW Extended Cab (F250/2500HD 6' bed) | $26.888.00 | $27.427.00] complient | $24:801.00] $26:808.35] $24,780.00 | Non Comﬂf’él $25,290.00




1B 3590 12/5112
Item 66 4x4 4,200 GVW Regular Cab (Tacoma, §° bed) . -
b i nb t/b e |aw b e
Cdaniel Ben Davis | Ben Davis Bok Sam Kelly Advantage.
CAB & CHASSIS Ford Ford | Chevrolet | Thomas |Swope Auto] Chevrolet [Uebethor Ford

Ttem 74B 4x2 14,001 GVWR Regular Cab (F450 Kodizk 60" CA) | $ 35,033.00 § 35.726.00 /b 's-'34;?s“'r.oo”: 1$35,233.95 nb b $35,390.00
Ttem 748 4x2 14,001 GVWR Regular Cab (F450 Kodiak 84" CA) | $55.185.00{ $35520.00]  nhb | $341915.00] $37,140.95| np nlb $35,540.00
Ttem 74D 4x2 16,001 GVWR Regular Cab (550 Kodiak 60" CA) | -$ 35,990.00 | '§ 36.788.00 nb | 'S34767.00] $35910.95 | nb b $36,345.00
Teem 74D 4x2 16,001 GVWR Regular Cab (F550 Kodiak 84" CAY | $36,142.00| $36864.00|  nb  |$34919.00] $36,062.95 | mib /b $36,495.00
Ttem 743 4x2 16,001 GVWR Extended Cab (F550 Kodiak 60" CA)| $37,860:00 | '$ 38,626.00 oo |$:36,537.00 $37.780.95 | nib nb $58,215.00
Ttem 743 4x2 16,001 GVWR Extended Cab (F550 C5500 54" CA) | $38,013.00| $ 38,753.00 no |'$36.790.00] $37.933.95| n/b b $38.375.00
Ttem 79B 454 16,001 GVWR Regular Cab (F550 C3500 60" CA) | $38,513.00| $30,206.001  nib $37.290.00| $38.433.95| nib nfb $38,870.00
Ttem 79 4x4 16,001 GVWR Regulor Cab (F550 CS500 847 CA) | $36.665.00| $30.45200 o | $37.442.00) $38.585.95 | b 1ok $39.020.00
Ttom 793 4x4 16,001 GVWR Extonded Cab (550 C5500 60" CA) | $40,005.00 $41,750.00]  wh | $30.682.00] $40,825.95 | nib nb $41.260.00
Ftem 793 4x4 16,001 GVWR Extended Cab (F550 C5500 34" CA) | $41,058.00} $43.185.00) - nb | §39835.001 $40.578.95) nb | nid $41,410.00
Hybrid green :
Ttem 7E (Electric sedan subcompact) nfb n'b n/b _ n/b n/b n'b iy nfb
Item SH 4x2 Hybrid clectric scdan sub compaet (Foeus electric) b $34,673.00 nfb n'b nfb nfb _tnb nb
Ttem 91 (Volt, Fusiou, electric sedan compact) nb $ 35,535.00] $37,254.86 nib nb | §267685.00 | nib o
Item 9H 4x2 Hybrid electric sedan sub compact 4 passenger 4 s
door '§24:923.00| $39,695.00 n/b n'b nb | nib. nfo n/b
item VP 4x2 Hybrid plug in HEY sedan compact 4 passeager 4
door /. b o s b [nb /b nib
Ttem 985 4x2 Hybrid electric 4800 GVW SUV Cmax $23,749.001 $22.936.00]  nh b b b nib nfb
Ttem 99H 4x4 Hybrid electric 4500 GVW-SUV nb afb nib n/b b | nb nfb




{ITB 3580 125512
(=101
Thomzs Sam
Qdaniet Ben Davis | Ben Davis Ford Swope Auto Kelly Advanfage
Sedons Ford Ford ' | Chevrolet | Lincoin Group Chevrolet |uebelhor Ford
. AT L. A . it b
Ttem SC (Caliber, Cobalt, Focns) $16,495.00/ $21,120.00] $ 18,502.35| comphant | $18.501.11] $17.625.00'| n/b .$16.398.00
Ttem 9C (Fusion, Malibu, Avenger 4cyl) $18,255.00 | $22,115.00{ $22,330.88|/5'17,000:00| $ 19.215.11 | §19.220.00 | $17.840.00 | $17,855.00
i [y i=r]
Item 9C (Malibu, Fusion, Avenger V-5). n/b n/b $24,144.88 |- $19:232.00] compliant [ wb Non Compliz n/b
Specicl police SUV
Ttem 17F Pobice Vehicle All wheel drive pursuit (Ford PIS) $ 24,039.00 | §24,386.00 nb  [$23:835:00] $25302:22| nib /b $24.276,00
hakel L .
Ttem 100L 432 Police use SUV pursuit 4 doors (Ford PIU) $25,073.00| compliant afb __ |:§25457.00] $26:841:28 | nfb. b $26,315.00
Ttem 17R Police Vehicle (Charger, Caprice 9CT) nib n/b $27.516.55 nb b ¥$76.64500 | Non Complia n/t
Ttem 17R Police Velricle (Charger, Caprice 9C3) b no | s2751555]  nw b | $26:25500 |:Non Complid nfb
Ttem 55C 4x4 6,700 GYW Crow Czb (F150/1500 6 bed) $27.283.00 | $26.411.00 niby $26,064.00| $27,359.25| $25450.00 | oo $26,540.00
Ytem 105C 4x4 Special Service 4 Door 5 Passenger-Special SVC _ ) SR i ST E Nt |
PKG $30,214.00| $35,856.00] $32.321.50| $28460.00 nlb 1§ 27.725.00:| Non Comiphig $26,565.007|
STV $x4 and 4x2. '
Item 91 FWD Crossover 5000 GVW Size 4 Door 6 Passenger vt
(Edge, Journey) 3 24,589.00| $2529C.00 n/b n/b nb $22100:00| n/b. $24,560.00
Iterm 96 AWD Crossover 5000 GVW Size 4 Door 5 Passenger ) Non: [ TS |
(Edge Equinox) $26,325.00 ] $29,9687.00] complient n/b nfb $23,714.00:] Non Complid $26,325.00
Item 968 4x2Z-Compact 4,500 GVW Size 4 Door7 Passenger Dl
(Equinox,Escape) $ 19587001 $23:273.00| $21,02411{ $22,284.00 o $20.585.00 | nfb n/b
Ttem 99 x4 Compact 4,500 GVW Size 4 Door 5 Passenger ’ ) Gt
(Equinox, Esezpe) $23,191.00 | $24.852.00] $.22,234.11| $23,824.00 n/b: $22,200,00 | $22.323.00 | nb
Item 100A 4x2 Tntermediate 5750 GVW Size 4 Door 5 Passenger ‘ _ L
(Explorer, Traverse) $24.883.00| $25.280.00| $24.645.55] $ 23.838.00 n/b $23755.001 $24.000.00 | $24695.00
item 105A. 434 Intermediate 5750-GVW Size 4 Door § Passenger o
{Explorer, Traverse) $26,673.00 1 $25,883.00] $26,505.55¢ $ 25,618.00 _ n/b $25,615.00] $25,950.00 | $26.475.00




[ITB 3590 12/5M12

(=41
Thomas | Sam
Cdzniel Ben Davie | Ben Davis Ford Swope Auto Kelly Advantage
Var Specifications Ford Ford ‘Chevrelet | Lincoln Group Chevrolet |Ulebelhor Ford
TIWAE S ; :
Item 22 4x2 12 Passenger Van Full Size (CG2300, E250) $25136.00| $23.720.00] complient | $23,841.00 o |'523,380:00] Non Co'm;sné $24,510.00
Ttom 24 4x2 15 Passenger Van Full Size Extended (CG3300. E350)| $27,137.00 | $26.016.00| $25607.25| §2524200|  nb | $25:860.00 | Non Compl'iJ $25,911.00
Item 30 432 Cargo Van Compact (Transit Conneet) 5,000 GVW e
'$21:434.00 nib nib $20.628.00 nib nb nib $21,585.00
Tiem 30E 452 Carzo- Van Compact (Transit Connect Electric) n/b nb nb n/b b nb n/b . nfb
TUUT R ]
Ftem 31X AWD Caroo Van Foll size (G1300) 6,001 GVW n/b b complient n/b n/b £25,650:00:] Non Complig n/b
Ttem 32 432 Carsro Van Full Size (CG2300, E150) 8.000 GVW | $21,166.00| $22.812.00 b afb b | 528:630.00 | Non Cempﬁe' Non Complic
Ttem 32 4x2 Cargo Van Full Size (CG2500, E150) 3,000 GVW _ e ‘4
Extended $22,103.00 | '$23,885.00 | $22.627.01 b nfo 522:300.00°{ Non Complig Nan Complic
Yterm 34 4x2 Cargo Van Fuoll Size Extended (CG3300. K350, Sprint] $24,796.00 Wb $25,083.25 b nb  |'823:520.00 | Non Complid $23,950.00
Ttem 34P 4x2 Cargo Van Full Size Extended (CG3500, E350, Props $ 25048001 nib $35,793.25 n/b nb | b b /b




Advantage Bimension
Ford- Sumrmit City Amell | Ford Lincoln Kelley
ITB #3313 Lincoln Inc. | Chevrolet Chevrolet Mereury Chevroiet | Ben Davis
4x2 PECKUPS
Ttem 41 432 6,050 GVW Regular Cab(F150/1500 §"long bed VE) Non e
Options: PWL, CR.IS.RE4, E35, D3 OR ATC. RKE, CTBP OR'CTE. T6A fResponsive bid No Bid No Bid | '$15,468.00} $16.,559.45| § 18,374.45
. Non : e
Ttem 43 4x2 6,050 GVW Rezuiar Cab (F150/1500.8°long Bidg bed V8) Responsive. I
Options: PWL, CR, E3. TS, RE4, £S5, D3 OR ATC. RKE, CTEP OR CIB. T6A - bid No Bid | $ 17.706.00) 817:269:.00| $17,210.95| $ 18,:370.45
Ftem 41C 4x2 6,700 GVW Extended Cab (F150/1500 6.5'bed) Responsive i S
Options: PWL, CR, TS, RE4, E$3, D3, RKE, CTBP OR CTE, T6A bid NoBid | $20,687.001'$18,913,00] $18,389.50| $21.075.56
Non Non Vet
Item 44 4x2 8,000 GVW Regular Cab (F250/2500 ED &’ long bed) Responsive Responsive S
Options: D3 OR ATC, PWL, CR, TS, RH4, CTBE OR CIEP, RKE. T6A. bid No Bid bid $19,630.00 | :519,659.667 § 19,804.66
Non:
Ttem 24P 4x2 8,000 GVW Extended Cab (F250/2500 HD 'S’ long bed propanc). Responsive’
COptions: D3 OR ATC. PWL, CR, TS. RE4, CTB OR CTBP. RKE, T6A - No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid. No Bid. bid
Non Non HEIET e
Ttem 44C 4x2 8,000 GVW Extended Cab (F250/2500 HD 8* bed Responsive Responsive {0 _
Options: D3 or ATC, PWL, CR. TS, RE4. CTE OR CTEP. RKE T6A. bid No-Bid bid -$21,648.00 $21,751.55 [ $22,033.05
Non Non R I
Ttem 24C-4x2 8,000 GVW Extended Cab (F250/2500 HD 6* bed Responsive Responsive | owii
Options: D3 OR ATC, PWL, CR. TS, RE4, CTE, RKE, L6, T6A bid No-Bid bid 821,478,001 $21,574.17 | $21.855.61
) [P Non
Ttern 50 4x2.6,000 GVW Crew Cab (F150/1500 5.5"bed V-6) Jedaot ] Responsive
Onptions: RE4, E95. D3 OR ATC, RKE., CTBP OR CTB, T6A $24,808.00] . NoBid |$22122.00] $21.871.00{:$21,378.25 bid
Noen
Ttem 60 4x2 4,200 GVW Standard Cab (Colorado, Ranger 6> bed) Responsive S
Options: 85, D3 OR ATC, RKE, E2, CRTS, PWL bid NoBid | §15,470.00 NoBid |:$15436.61]% 16.022.36-
Ttem 61C 4x2 4,200 GVW Extended Cab(Colorado, Ranger 6° bed) e
Options: E85, D3 OR ATC. RKE, CRTS, PWL $15.588.00] NoBid {$18,272.00] $:15,897.00] $ 165,12445| 5 16,424.65
4x4 PICKUPS
. Non B
item 46 4x4 6,000 GVW Standard Cab (F150/1500 S*long bed) Responsive ey
Options: PWL. CR, TS, RE4, E3, £85, D5 OR ATC RKE, CTBP OR CTB $20,410.00 NeBid | bid $20,202.00 :520,167.951 § 20.703.95
Ttem 46C 4% 6,250 GVW Extended Cab (FI50/1500-5 long bed) : P
Options: PWL. CR, TS, RHE4. E85, D3 OR ATC, RKE. CTEP OR CTB $23903.001 NoBid ['$23,878.00($23,687.001 $23,834.11{524,270.11
Item 46C 4x4 6,250 GVW Extended Cab (F150/1500 6’long bed) ‘ _ S I
Options: PWL, CR, TS, RE4. ESS, D3 OR ATC, RKE, CTEP OR CTE, L6, T6A $21,783.00 NoBid | $23,537.00 $21,662.00: § 24.132.81
i Non . i ;
Item 49 4x4 2,000 GVW Repular Cab (F250/2500HD $? bed) Responsive | : T :
fgptions: D3 OR ATC, EM. PW, CR. TS, RH4, CTE OR CTBP., RKE, SU4, T6A bid NoBid | $22.881.00 $22.582.75 | $ 22.600.00




Advantage

Dimension

‘ Ford Summit City Amell jFordlincoln]| Kelley
TR #3313 Lincolninc. |  Chevrolet Chevrolet Mercury | . Chovrolet | BenDavis
. Mon BRI o
Ttem 4984x4 9,201 GVW Regular Czb (F350/5500HD 87 bed) Responsive : R CER
Optitns: D3 OR ATC, RM. PWL, CR. TS, RH4, CTB OR CIBP, RKE, SU4..SZ T6A. bid NoBid {$23.594.00|$ 23:008.00| 523,385.65 | $23,530.65
Ttem 49C 434 5,000 GVW Extended Cab (F250/2500HD §° bed) S ]
Options: D5 OR ATC. RM, PWL, CR, TS. RH4, CTE OR CIEP, RKE. SU4, T6A $24343.00| -NoBid | $24447.00} $24,335,00] 32407466 $ 24,228.66
Ttem: 49C 4x4 5,000 GVW Extended Cab (F250/2500HI 6° bed) e
Options: D3 OR ATC, RM, PWL, CR, TS, RH4, CTB OR CTEP.RKE, SU4, L6. T6A.__| $24,178.00] NoBid | $24.205.00] $24,171.00 --'5' 23-397;2’0‘- $ 24,051.20
Ttem 55 4x4 6,700 GVW Crew Cab (FI150/1500 6° bed) : :
Options: £85, DS OR ATC, RE4, RKE, T6A $25429.00| NoBid |:$23108.00] $25620.00]% 22 979 75 §24,089.26
Ttera56C 4x4 §,000 GVW Crew Cab (F250/2500 6 bed) ' .
Options: B85, D3 OR ATC,PWL, CR. TS.RH4, RKE, T6A $25,285.00| MNoBid | 525037.001 $25405.00 f's 24 965 55 5 25,028.55
Xeem 56C dx4 §,000 GVW Cresy Cab (F150/1500 3" bed). :
Options: E83, D3 OR ATC, WL.CR. TS, RE4, LB. RKE, T6A $25454.00F NoBid | $25215.00| §25575.00: _3'25,‘140.01- $25,018.81
[Itcm 66C 4x4 4,200 GVW Extended Cab(Colorade, Ranger 6 bed) Gl
'Options: ES5, D3 OR ATC, RE3, RKE, CRTS, PWL $18381.00} NoBid |$19,707.00! $18:2330.00| $19.422.95{5 18,873.45
Cab & Chassis T
ItemG7E 4x4 4,200 GVW Crew Czb (Colorado, Ranger 6° bed) A
Options: £85, D3 OR ATC, RH3, RKE, CRTS, PWL No Bid No Bid $21,126.00 NoBid | $20,96961(821.219.11
Non SRR
Item 74B 4x2 14,001 GVWR Regular Cab (F450 Kodiak 667CA). Responsive |
Optivns: YD, PT, B3 OR ATC, SU4, S2, PWL, CR, T8, CTZ OR CTBP; Al4, FB20 bid No Bid No.Bid No Bid No Bid
Item 74B 4x2 14,001 GVWR Regalar Cab (F450 Kodiak S4°CA) Nen
QOptions: YD, PT, D3 QR ATC, SU4, $Z. PWL, CR, TS, CTE OR CTEP, CAS, Al4, Respensive R
FB20 bid No Bid NoBid | '$34,14600] NoSid | NoBid
Non S ’
Itemn 74D 4x2 16,001 GVWR Regular Cab (F550 Kodiak 60"CA) Responsive | R
Options: YD, PT. D3 OR ATC, SU4, SZ. PWL, CR, TS, CTB OR CTEP, Al4, FB20 bid No Bid NoBid |[:$34.777.00] NoBid No Bid
’ Noh ’ o - ’
Ttem 74D 4x2 16,001 GVWR Regular Cab (F550 Kodiak $47CA) Responsive | c i
Optiers: CAS. YD, PT. D3, 804, 87, PWL, CR, TS, CTB OR CIEP, A14, FB20 bid No Bid No Bid $34,947.00] NoBid | NoBid
Non — _
Ttem 743 4x2 16,001 GVWR Extended Cab (F550 Xodmlk 60°CA) Responsive R
Options: YD, FT, B3, ST4, SZ. PWL, CR. TS, CTR OR CTEP. Al4, FEI0 bid No Bid NoBid |'$38:76500] NoBid |NeBid
Ttem 74J 4x2.16,001 GVWR Extended Cab (F550 C5500 847CA) o ] '
Options: CAS, YD, PT, D3 OR ATC, SU4, $Z, PWL, CR, TS, CTE OR CTBP, A14, S
FB20 $36,870.00] NoBid NoBid |§36943.00] NoBid |NoBid
Tem 797 4x4 16,001 GVWR Extended Cab (F550 C5500 607CA) e
Options: YD, PT, D3 OR ATC, S5U4, SZ, FWL. CR, TS, CTB OR CTBP. Al4, FB20 $39,874.00 No Bid NoBid |:$3896700] NoBid |NoBid
Ttern 793 dx4 16,001 GVWR Extentced Cab (5550 03500 $47CA) BN
Options: CAS, YU, PT, D3 OR ATC, $U4,82. PWL, CR, TS, CYB OR CTBP, Al4,
FB20 $ 40,152.00 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Big

Hybrid green




‘Advantage Dimension
Ford | SummitCity Amell | Ford Lincoln Kelley-
ITE #3313 Lincoln Inc. |  Chevrolet Chevrolet Mercury Chevrolet | Ben Davis
Item 7E (Electric sedan subcompact)
Options: PWD. RKE. CR. TS No Bid ‘No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  { NeBid
ftem 8K 4x2 Hybrid clectric sedaNe Bid sub-compact (Civic, Prius) . No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No-Bid - No Bid Ne Bid
Item 9D (Volt, FusioNo Bid, clectric sedan compact)
Options: ATC . No Bid No Bid No Bid No.Bid No Bid i NoBid
Ttem 9H 4x2 Hybrid electric sedan sub compact 4 passenger 4 door R
(Malibn HYB, Fusionhev} $25,950.00 No Bid NoBid |'$25772.00f NoBid [ NoBid
Iterz 55H 434 6,700 GVW Crew Cab (KIS00EEV 6 bed) [T
Options: D3, RE4 No-Bid No Bid 3 35,446.00 NoBid ['535274101%36,158.35
Item 98K 2x2 Hybrid ¢lectrie 4,800 GVW SUV-(Escape Hybridvue) $27,752.00 No Bid NoBid {:$27.575.00 No Bid | No:Bid
Itemn 99H 4x4 Hybrid clectric 4500 GVW SUV. (Escape Hybridvoe) $29.284.00 NoBid NoBid |'$2911500f{ NobBid [NoBid
Itern 100H 4x2 Eybrid electric 7,300 GVW SUV (Tahoe) R
Options: £$3. D3 OR ATC — _ No Bid NoBid 15 45945.00 Ne Bid $45 77353 $48,572.53
Ltern 105H 4x4 Hybrid electric 7,500 GVW SUV (Tzhoe) : e
Options: £85; D3 OR ATC No Bid NoBid | $4851200| NoBid |:$48.540:40]540138.10
Sedans
Non
Ttem 8C (Caliber, Cruze, Focus) Responsive i
Options: £35. PWD, RKE, CR, ATC. T6A bid NoBid [$17,034.001:318178.00) §17.020.26 'S 18,137.51
Jtern 9C (Fusion, Maliby, Avenger 4cy) : ST )
Onptions: 85, PWD, ATC, T6A $16.535.00f NoBid 1$16.932.00($16,362.00] $168,703.36 | $ 15,9361
Iter: 90 (Maiibu, Fesion, Avenger V-6) | :
Options: E85, ATC, T6A $17.966.00 NoBid | $20414.00|7827.793.00] $20,341.061$20.861.98
Item 108 (impala, Tauros, Charger V-6) i e A
Options: E35, ATC, T6A $19,765.00) NoBid . |:$17,825.00] $19.586.00] $.17.919.66] 35 18,356.66
Special police SUV
Item I7F 9C1 Police Vehicle Front whee? drive (Impala, Taorus) e ]
Options: ES5, SL. PEPP (includes GM codes 613, 634, 637) CM., KA B34 No-Bid $20,672.00] % 20,383.00 NoBid | $12,763.061$.20,568:87
Iem 17F 9C3 Police Vehicle Front wheel drive (Impala; Tanrus) ) R RO Po
‘Options: E$5, PEPP (includes GM eodes 633, 634, 677 CML ST, KA. B34 NoBid | $20,420.00| $20,141.001 NoBid  |:$15520:87]$ 20,344.56
Item 17R Police Vehicle (Crown Vie, Charger, Caprice 9C1) : SRR
‘Options: ESS, D3 OR ATC, RKE, SL; PWD, CR. PEPP, PWL, CM. KA B34, K4S $21.762.00] $26,371.00] $25,698.001:$21,503.00] §$25,357.30| $26,119.55
Jterm 17R Police Vehicle (Crown Vie, Charger, Caprice $C3) e .
‘Options: £85, D3 OR ATC, RKE. PWD, CR. PEPP, PWL, SF, CM. K4, E34, K4S $21,577.00 | §25,980.00 $ 25,307.001 $21,433.00} $25,006.30 | $ 26,119.55
Ttem 100L 4x2 Police use SUV pursuit 4 doors (Tahod) Responsive S
Optisns: E85. D5 OR ATC. RKE. SL. PEPP. KA No Bid $26,404.00) bid. No Bid  |:$252032 804'S 26,708.55
Ytem 105C 4x4 Special Serviee 4 Door5 Passenger Special SVC PKG ST }
Options: E85. D3 OR ATC, RH4, CTB, OR CTEP (Expedition, Tahoo) $27,905.00| $28,400,00| $27,862.00 |:$27.368.00) $ 27,727.75|.$ 32,732.50

SUV 4x4 and 4x2




Advaniage Dimension
Ford -Summit City Amell  jForglincoln]|  Kelley
1B #3313 Lincoln Ing. §  Chewrolet Chevrolst Mercury Chevrolet | Ben Davis
Item 91 FWD Crossover S000:GVW Size 4 Door 6 Passeager e .
Options: B35, D3 OR ATC, RE4, T6A (Edee, Journcey, Terrain) $22.738.00 No Bid NoBid [$22555:00] NobBid |$25622.40
item 96 AWD Crossover 5000 GV'W Size 4 Door 6 Passenger ’ e .
|Options: ES5, D3, OR ATC, RE4, T6S (Edge Terrain) $24384.00] MNoBid NoBid {'$24.20500)° NoBid |$27.23240
Item 98 4x2 Compact 4,500 GVW Size 4 Deor 5 Passenzer i
Options: E85. D3 OR ATC, RE2, T6A (Equinox, Escapc) $18,812.00 NoBid | $23408.00|'$15790.00] $23.087.45| §25.622.40
Item 99 4x4 Compact 4,500 GVW.Size 4 Door 5 Passenger I
Options: E35, D3 OR ATC, RH2, T6S (Equirox, Escape) $21,152.00] NoBid | $25.018.00( $18348.00 $24697.45] $ 27.232.40
Item J00A 4x2 Intermediate 5750 GVW Size 4 Door 5 Passenger El e
Options: E85, D53 OR ATC. RH4, T6S (Explorer, Traversc) $22,658.00(  NoBid NoBid |1522,518.00] $24,170.08 | $27.535.00
lzem 1054, 4x4 Intermediate 5750 GYW Size 4 Door 5 Passenger )
Options: E85, D3 OR ATC, RE4 (Explorer, Traverse) $24,478.00 No Bid No Bid  |'§24,286.00 $26,010.08| $28,773.58
Var Specifications .
Itern 21 (8) Passenger Van Full size (CGI300, EI150) L
Options: ES5, RE4, D3 OR ATC, CRTS, PWL, WD, RD, RKE, T6A $21.372.00 No Bid $21,186.00| §$21,452.00 | $:21,230:00] $ 22,070.75
— P Non
Ttem 23X AWD (8) Passenger Van Full size (CG1300, E150) | vaininih] Responsive
Options: E55. RA4, D3 OR ATC, CRTS, PWL, WD, RD, RKE, T6A No Bid NoBid | $26,185.00 NoBid . | $26615.57] bid
Ttem 22 432 (12) Passcnger Van Full size (CG2500, E250). ' T _
Options: ES5. RH4, D3 OR ATC, CRTS, PWL. WD, RD, RKE, T6A $23.386.00 No Bid $22,181.00] $23,445:00}:§21,740:50} § 22,790.00
Non e
Ttem 24 4x2 15 Passenger Van Full size extended (CG3300, E350) Responsive | Sln
COptions: E85, R4, D3 OR ATC. CRTS. PWL. W, RD. RKE, RMS6, T6A bid Ne Bid $ 25.605.001:5'24,990.00] §26,501.50 | $.28,570.75
Item 30-4x2 Cargo Var (Transit Conect) 5,000 GVW :
Options: AC2. AHL E$5, RH4, D3 OR ATC, TS, CR. PWL, WD, DTG $20,283.00 No:Bid NoBid | 3204137001 NoBid |NoBi
Tter:30E 4x2 Carge Van Compzct (Transit Connect Electric)- :
Orptions: AC2, AHL RE4, D3 CR ATC, TS, CR. PWL. WD DTG. 5,000 GVW No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid
Non Non R
{Ttem 31 4x2 Cargo Van Full size (G1300, EX50) 6,001 GVW V-6 | Responisive Responsive St
Options: AC2, AH.ES5. RH4, D3 OR ATC, TS, CR, PWL. WD, PTG, T6A hid No Bid bid . NoBid |:5$18.867.50]520,183.50
Item 31X AWD Carge Van Fall size (G1500) 6,001 GVW o Responsive
Options: ACZ. AHL ES5, RH4, D3 OR ATC, TS, CR, PWL. WD, DTG, RKE. T6A. No 8id No Bid $24627.00) NoBd 1:325057.00 bid
Non T
Item 32 4x2 Cargo Van Full size (CG2300, E150)'5,000 GVW Responsive Sl _
Optiens: AC2, AH. ES5, RH4, D3 OR ATC, T8, CR, PWL, WD, DTG, RKE, T6A. bid: No Bid $-19,690.00.1.$18,789.00] - $20,120.00 | $20,133:25
Item 32.4x2 Carpe Van Fuall size (CG2300, E150) 8,000 GVW Extended B R P T
Options: ACZ, AH, ES5, RH4, D3 OR ATC, TS, CR, PWL, WD, DTG. RKE, X1, T6A | $20,054.00{ NoBid §21,364.00 /5 19.252.00 | .§21,797.00{ $21,807.25
Hem 34 4x2 Cargo Van Foll size extended (CG3300, E350 Sprinter) s o .
Options: AC2, AH, £85, RE4, D3 OR ATC, TS, CR, PWL, WD, DTG, RKE T6A -$22,365.00 No Bid $23,475.00}'§22,742.00} 523.904.51,523,998.13




- Advantage . Dimension
Ford Summit City Amell | Ford Linceln Kelley
TTB #3313 | Lincolning, | Chevrolet Chevrolet Mereury Cheviolet | Ben Davis
. R Non
Ttemn 34P 4x2 Cargo VaNo Bid Full size extended (CG3300, E350, Propanc) B T Responsive
Options: ACZ, AH. E85, R4, D3 OR ATC. TS, CR, PWL. WD, DTG, RKE, T6A Nc Bid No Bid No Bid 1$32,855.:001 % 36,180.50 bid




To:

From: Larry Campbell, Fleet Director/Manager

Date: 1/23/2013

Re: ITB #3522 those that did not meet spec Non-compliant

Uebelhor Chavrolet low bids that did not meet specs
item 22 bld vinyl seats, vinyt floors no carpet, Am FM radio only, No rear heat & alr,
ltem 24 bid vinyl saats, vinyl floors no carpet,

item 31X Bid rear wheel drive and not AWD

Item 32 No radlo

ltem 32 extended no radio

Htem 34 vinyl seats, no radio

ltem 44C Ext cab 8' bed vinyl seats, AM/FM radio only

ltem 44C Ext cab 6' bed vinyl seats, AM/FM radio only

Item 46 vinyl seats, AM/FM radio, only no skid plate

ltemn 46C vinyl seats, AM/IFM radlo, only 16 skid plate

item 46C vinyl seats, AM/FM radio, only no skid plate

ltem 49 vinyl seats, AM/FM radio, only no skid plate

Jtem 49 B vinyl seats, AM/FM radio,

Item 49C Ext cab 8' bed vinyl seats, AM/FM radio only

ltem 49C Ext cab 6' bed vinyl seats, AM/FM radio onl}

@ Page 1




17R 9¢1 No dual batterles, No factory wiring, bid V6

17R 9¢3 No factory wiring, bid V6

105C No Skid Plate

96 Lower trim level bid a LS nota LT GM codes

Item 9C bid a 2012 Impala not a Malibu

Ben Davis Chevrolet

ltern 22 bid vinyl seats, vinyl floors no carpet, Am FM radio only, No rear heat & air,
Item 24 bid vinyl seats, vinyl floors no carpet,

Jtern 31X vinyl seats, no power windowsflocks, tinted glass,

ltem 44C Ext cab 8" bed vinyl seats, No skid plate

ttem 96 bid a 1LS not 1LT

Sam Swope Auto Group

ltem 9C transposed number with V6 to 4cyl number

Bob Thomas Ford

ltern 8C bid manual transmission

Ben Davis Ford

ltlem 46C AM FM radio only No upgrade package, no door remole
Itern 100 L bid a sedan nota SUV

Advantage Ford

Item 32 no dark tinted glass, no 6 speed fransmission

ltom 32 extended van rio dark tinted glass, no 6 speed transmission
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COUNCIL
DIGEST SHEET

ENCLOSED WITH THIS INTRODUCTION FORM IS A TAB SHEET AND RELATED MATERIAL FROM
THE VENDOR {8y WHO SUBMITTED BID (S). PLEASE FILL OUT THE FOLLOWING INFORMATION

AND RETURN TO PURCHASING:

BID#ITB 3313 andd ITB 3520  AWARDED TO; Kelly Chevrolet, Bob ‘FThomas Ford, Q'Banief Ford,

AMOUNT; IN EXCESS OF $100,000.00 from Departmments CIP
WAS _X_' WAS NOT THE LOWEST, MOST RESPONSIVE AND MOST RESPONSIBLE OF
RIDDERS. IF NOT LOWEST, GIVE EXPLANATION FOR NOT OBTAINING LOW BID:

DESCRIPTION QF PROJECT (BE SPECIFIC AND QUANTIFY):

Purchase of 1eglacement vehicles for different cify depariments for out of life cycle vehicles, If the purchases are
apps woved the money ES in the individual dcpmlments CIP that were approved in ihe;e 2013 budgets. Re- bid of
del itl d on. Other d

municipalities will be purchasing off of‘ the Cllv bid because some of ihe pricing is lowe! than the state QPA.

IF REPLACEMENT, WHAT NECESSITATES:

Qut-of-life cycle vehicles, pickups, vans, and small dump tracks. High mileage, high mmntenmwe cost and high
poiuts using th cbointsvstcm .

WHAT ARE THE IMPLICATIONS IF PURCHASE IS NOT APPROVED?
Higheir maisitenance cost,

I PRIOR APPROVAL IS BEING REQUESTED, HUSTIFY:

PREPARED BY: Lacry Campbell DATE: January 15, 2013




To:  Council & Purchase

Fromz:Larry Campbell, Fleet Director/fManager

Date: 1/23/2013

Re: 2013 Vehicle purchases by Department

Below please find the requested vehicle purchases for the City, The cost break down reflects the bid
prices using GSA spec's and purchase prices from ITB #3313; and ITB #3590; these amounts have
already been approved in their Capital budget lings. These vehicles will all be replacements for over life
cycle units. (Years, maintenance cost, & mileage).

Animal Gontrol: (2) Vans
Fire: (7) Vehicles
Police: {70) Vehicles
Street project Management: (2) Pickups
Street light operation: (2) Pickups
Street Department: (1) Pickup
Transportation Administration: (1) Pickup
Filtration Plant (1) Utility truck
Water Pollution Control Maintenance (WPCM): (1) Pickup
Water Maintenance (WMS): (3) Vehicles
Water Pollution Control Plant (WPCP): {1) Pickup

91 Vehicles total for all departments

Break down of cost by Divislons
Public Safety $ 1,717,255.14
Public works $129,921.00
Utiiities $150,658.75

Total $1,997,834.89

@ Page 1




To Councilf City Purchasing

From: Larry Campbell Fleet Manager/Diractor
Date:  1/23/2013

Re: Break down by Vendor

A break down of cost going to each vendor for Cily purchases

Bob Thomas Ford $414,642,
O'Daniel Ford $113,943.

Kelly Chevrolet Total $1,469,249.89
Total $1,997,834.89
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